

- Base List:
- Bergstrom
 - Brooks
 - Carswell
 - Castle
 - Chanute
 - Eaker
 - England
 - Galena
 - Gentile
 - George
 - Griffiss
 - Grissom
 - Homestead
 - KISawyer
 - Kelly
 - Loring
 - Lowry
 - March
 - Mather
 - McClellan
 - Myrtle Beach

[Help or Questions?](#)

Subject or Title:

Author:

Corporate / Author Affil:

Recipient:

Recipient Affili:

After Date:

Sites:

Before Date:

OU's:

Full Metadata Search:
(or AR Number)

Full Document Search:

Search resulted in 251 hits

	Score	PDF Size	Filename	Subject or Title	Author	Doc Date
View	100	11.18	MARCH_AR_1.pdf	Administrative Record File Index		12/6/2002
View	10	0.04	MARCH_AR_1817.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Oct 00		10/19/2000
View	10	0.08	MARCH_AR_981.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Nov 98		11/19/1998
View	50	3.52	MARCH_AR_890.pdf	ROD, Draft Final, OU-2		11/1/1998
View	50	3.51	MARCH_AR_826.pdf	ROD, OU-2		2/1/1998
View	10	14.25	MARCH_AR_678.pdf	RI/FS, Draft Final Report, Vol I of XVII, OU-2		7/1/1997
View	10	6.64	MARCH_AR_787.pdf	Closure Report, Removal of Wastes, Vol I of II, LF-06		4/1/1997
View	20	12.24	MARCH_AR_743.pdf	Removal of Wastes Report, Vol I of II, LF-03		2/1/1997
View	20	0.07	MARCH_AR_698.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 12 Jun 96		6/12/1996
View	10	0.24	MARCH_AR_644.pdf	IT Corp Letter to USACE Transmitting Remediation Report, Site 6C, 6D and 6E	Grant, Don / IT Corp.	4/23/1996
View	20	10.01	MARCH_AR_639.pdf	Work Plan, Munitions and Burial Pit Excavation and Removal, WP-25		4/1/1996
View	20	2.64	MARCH_AR_612.pdf	Site HSP, Subsurface Investigation and Removal Action, OU-2, Site L		3/1/1996
View	10	1.56	MARCH_AR_592.pdf	Site HSP, Subsurface Investigation and Removal Action, OU-2, Site L		2/1/1996
View	40	8.41	MARCH_AR_572.pdf	Summary of Tank Removal Report and Site Investigation for the former Hawes Radio Relay Station, Site 41		1/1/1996
View	100	3.32	MARCH_AR_544.pdf	ROD, OU-1		12/1/1995
View	10	0.32	MARCH_AR_589.pdf	Comparative Cost Evaluation Report of GETS and Groundwater Treatment Options, SS-31		10/1/1995
View	30	0.28	MARCH_AR_753.pdf	Supplemental Environmental Baseline Survey (EBS), Bldgs 2629, 2630, 2631, 2632, and		9/28/1995

				2670 and Associated Paved Parking		
View	10	0.07	MARCH_AR_519.pdf	Public Meeting Minutes, Draft Site Specific Removal Action Memorandum and Consolidation of LF-06		9/6/1995
View	10	4.22	MARCH_AR_444.pdf	Final Report, Additional Investigations, OU-2, WP-02		8/1/1995
View	10	10.70	MARCH_AR_367.pdf	As-Built Documentation and Closure Certification Report, Vol IV of V, LF-04		8/1/1995
View	30	6.95	MARCH_AR_368.pdf	As-Built Documentation and Closure Certification Report, Vol V of V, LF-04		8/1/1995
View	20	4.19	MARCH_AR_477.pdf	Final Seismic-Reflection Survey Report, OU-2		7/1/1995
View	20	0.17	MARCH_AR_481.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 20 Jun 95		6/20/1995
View	91	10.12	MARCH_AR_469.pdf	Final Rapid Response Time Critical Removal Action Report, Vol I of II, LF-40		6/1/1995
View	30	8.21	MARCH_AR_389.pdf	Final Closure/Post Closure Maintenance Plan, LF-06		5/1/1995
View	70	9.64	MARCH_AR_468.pdf	Phase II, Final Rapid Response Work Plan, LF-06		5/1/1995
View	10	0.09	MARCH_AR_478.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 19 Apr 95		4/19/1995
View	10	6.58	MARCH_AR_393.pdf	RI, Stage 5, Draft Report, Vol I of V, OU-2		4/1/1995
View	50	0.03	MARCH_AR_1263.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 29 Mar 95		3/29/1995
View	91	0.09	MARCH_AR_392.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 29 Mar 95		3/29/1995
View	100	0.09	MARCH_AR_415.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 29 Mar 95		3/29/1995
View	10	0.28	MARCH_AR_901.pdf	SOW, Additional Site Characterization and Treatability Study, SS-31, ST-34		3/28/1995
View	30	0.04	MARCH_AR_418.pdf	CRWQCB Letter to Base Concerning 401 Certification for the Stabilization of Three Existing Landfills	Thibeault, Gerald J / California Regional Water Quality Control Board	3/20/1995
View	20	0.05	MARCH_AR_1261.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Draft Work Plan, Phased TCE Investigations, OU-2	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	3/15/1995
View	20	0.07	MARCH_AR_1260.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Draft Work Plan, Tank Removal and SI, ST-41	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	3/14/1995
View	30	0.02	MARCH_AR_1258.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Preliminary Draft Final Report, Time Critical Removal Action, LF-04	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	3/10/1995
View	30	0.06	MARCH_AR_1259.pdf	Action Memorandum, LF-04, OU-1		3/10/1995
View	20	0.28	MARCH_AR_1257.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Invitation to Review Site Technology Capsule, UVB Technology	Simon, Michelle / EPA Risk Reduction Engineering Laboratory	3/8/1995
View	30	0.03	MARCH_AR_1256.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning Approval of Site Specific Action Memorandum, LF-06	Arellano, Albert A, Jr / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	3/3/1995
View	100	3.79	MARCH_AR_307.pdf	BRAC Cleanup Plan (BCP)		3/1/1995
View	30	0.04	MARCH_AR_1255.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Draft Work Plan, Tank Removal and SI, ST-41	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	2/22/1995
View	50	0.11	MARCH_AR_416.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 22 Feb 95		2/22/1995
View	40	0.16	MARCH_AR_1254.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Additional Comments on Draft, Site Specific Action Memorandum, LF-06	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	2/15/1995
View	20	0.44	MARCH_AR_355.pdf	Addendum Letter Report for the Summary of Subsurface Investigation and Removal Action, WP-36		2/14/1995

View	10	0.02	MARCH_AR_1253.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Fact Sheet Release to Public Without EPA Review, LF-06	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	2/10/1995
View	20	1.03	MARCH_AR_356.pdf	Addendum Letter Report for the Summary of Subsurface Investigation and Removal Action, WP-02		2/8/1995
View	20	0.86	MARCH_AR_357.pdf	Addendum Letter Report for the Summary of Subsurface Investigation and Removal Action, WP-17		2/6/1995
View	10	0.12	MARCH_AR_997.pdf	Offbase Private Boring and Well Completions Logs, Vol I of IV		2/1/1995
View	30	0.13	MARCH_AR_1252.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Site Specific Action Memorandum, LF-06	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	1/31/1995
View	30	0.11	MARCH_AR_1251.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Draft Seismic Reflection Survey, OU-2	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	1/24/1995
View	20	0.06	MARCH_AR_1250.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Site Specific Action Memorandum, LF-06	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	1/23/1995
View	40	7.49	MARCH_AR_1249.pdf	Site Assessment Report, Summary of Tank Removal, ST-41		1/19/1995
View	30	0.03	MARCH_AR_1248.pdf	CRWQCB Letter to Base Concerning Approval for Diversion of Effluent Discharge, Groundwater Extraction Treatment System	Adackapara, Michael / California Regional Water Quality Control Board	1/13/1995
View	60	0.05	MARCH_AR_1246.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 12 Jan 95		1/12/1995
View	81	0.32	MARCH_AR_1247.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 12 Jan 95		1/12/1995
View	100	0.17	MARCH_AR_374.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 11 Jan 95		1/11/1995
View	20	0.17	MARCH_AR_898.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Draft ROD, OU-1	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	12/30/1994
View	30	0.10	MARCH_AR_1244.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Investigation and Removal Proposal, LF-06	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	12/27/1994
View	10	0.03	MARCH_AR_1241.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 08 Dec 94		12/8/1994
View	20	0.06	MARCH_AR_1164.pdf	IAG, Proposed Stream or Lake Alteration, LF-04	Sabol, John R, Dr Sudduth, Dee / 722 CES/CEV California Department of Fish and Game	12/1/1994
View	10	0.35	MARCH_AR_1240.pdf	Base Letter to EPA Transmitting Comments on UVB Videoscript and Animation Storyboard, SS-31	Sabol, John R, Dr / 722 CES/CEV	11/23/1994
View	30	0.11	MARCH_AR_1239.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Draft Phased TCE Investigation, OU-2	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	11/21/1994
View	30	0.04	MARCH_AR_1238.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Draft Channel Construction Plan, Final Work Plan, LF-40	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	11/18/1994
View	100	0.05	MARCH_AR_224.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 16 Nov 94		11/16/1994
View	100	0.08	MARCH_AR_223.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 16 Nov 94		11/16/1994
View	100	0.15	MARCH_AR_180.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 16 Nov 94		11/16/1994
View	30	0.05	MARCH_AR_1237.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Draft Work Plan, Additional Investigations, OU-2	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	11/8/1994
View	30	0.09	MARCH_AR_897.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning Additional Investigations, OU-2	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	11/8/1994

View	30	8.07	MARCH_AR_860.pdf	Basewide Environmental Baseline Survey (EBS)		11/1/1994
View	10	0.06	MARCH_AR_339.pdf	Action Memorandum, Removal Action, LF-40		10/24/1994
View	30	0.47	MARCH_AR_896.pdf	Fact Sheet, The Green Sheet		10/21/1994
View	70	0.08	MARCH_AR_36.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Oct 94		10/19/1994
View	100	0.05	MARCH_AR_35.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 19 Oct 94		10/19/1994
View	100	0.14	MARCH_AR_97.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Oct 94		10/19/1994
View	20	0.04	MARCH_AR_1236.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Technical Memorandum, Dual Phase Groundwater SVE, SS-31	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	10/7/1994
View	10	5.86	MARCH_AR_347.pdf	Summary of Subsurface Investigation and Removal Action Report, WP-02		10/1/1994
View	10	7.56	MARCH_AR_340.pdf	Final Project Work Plans, Time-Critical Removal Action, LF-40		10/1/1994
View	60	3.79	MARCH_AR_349.pdf	Summary of Subsurface Investigation and Removal Action Report, WP-17		10/1/1994
View	10	0.03	MARCH_AR_1234.pdf	CDTSC Letter to AFVW Concerning Response to Comments on Need for Investigation, LF-06, LF-20, WP-26	Arellano, Albert A, Jr / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	9/30/1994
View	30	0.07	MARCH_AR_1233.pdf	AFVW Letter to CDTSC Concerning Comments on Remediation	Farris, Jack K / Air Force Village West	9/28/1994
View	10	0.17	MARCH_AR_50.pdf	Public Hearing Transcript for Proposed Plan, OU-3		9/26/1994
View	20	0.12	MARCH_AR_1232.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments and Request for Review Version, Draft ROD, OU-1	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	9/22/1994
View	40	0.04	MARCH_AR_343.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning Immediate Response Action and Investigations, LF-06, WP-26	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	9/22/1994
View	20	0.05	MARCH_AR_1231.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Draft Proposed Plan, ST-33	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	9/12/1994
View	10	0.04	MARCH_AR_1230.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 07 Sep 94		9/7/1994
View	10	0.09	MARCH_AR_1229.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 07 Sep 94		9/7/1994
View	100	0.32	MARCH_AR_72.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 07 Sep 94		9/7/1994
View	10	0.06	MARCH_AR_1228.pdf	PRC Letter to EPA Concerning Incorporating Comments, Draft Demonstration Bulletin, UVB Technology, SS-31	Argus, Roger / PRC Environmental Management, Inc.	9/2/1994
View	10	0.73	MARCH_AR_2144.pdf	Least Bell's Vireo Survey Report	Kobetich, Gail C. / United States Department of the Interior Fish and Wildlife Service	9/2/1994
View	20	0.71	MARCH_AR_345.pdf	Letter Comment/Response Matrix on Draft FS Report, OU-3		9/1/1994
View	30	0.11	MARCH_AR_417.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Final Improvements Work Plan, Heacock Drainage Channel, LF-04	Arellano, Albert A, Jr / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	9/1/1994
View	30	2.55	MARCH_AR_424.pdf	Archives Search Report Findings, Conclusions and Findings, Ordnance and Explosive Waste Chemical Warfare Materials		9/1/1994
View	100	14.11	MARCH_AR_423.pdf	Archives Search Report Findings, Ordnance and Explosive Waste Chemical Warfare Materials		9/1/1994
View	30	0.03	MARCH_AR_1227.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning No Comments on Final Work Plan, Geophysical Survey, OU-2	Arellano, Albert A, Jr / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	8/30/1994

View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1226.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning No Further Comments on RI/FS Report, OU-1	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	8/23/1994
View	30	0.71	MARCH_AR_317.pdf	Comment Resolution Report, Response to Comments on Draft FS Report, OU-3		8/22/1994
View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_1225.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Immediate Response Action and SI	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	8/15/1994
View	10	0.03	MARCH_AR_1224.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 03 Aug 94		8/3/1994
View	10	0.07	MARCH_AR_1223.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 03 Aug 94		8/3/1994
View	10	1.11	MARCH_AR_273.pdf	Work Plan, Additional Investigations, OU-2		8/1/1994
View	10	5.11	MARCH_AR_306.pdf	RI, Report, Vol III of III, ST-33		8/1/1994
View	40	0.20	MARCH_AR_160.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 27 Jul 94		7/27/1994
View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1222.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning No Comments on Corrective Action Plan, Supplement of Work Plan Addendum, OU-2	Scandura, John E / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	7/14/1994
View	20	0.06	MARCH_AR_1221.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Evaluation of GETS	Ghazi, Rizgar A / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	7/11/1994
View	30	0.15	MARCH_AR_1220.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on SEMIST System Installation Work Plan, SS-31	Ghazi, Rizgar A / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	7/8/1994
View	10	0.85	MARCH_AR_1219.pdf	Bioventing Pilot Test Work Plan, Results Report, ST-35		7/1/1994
View	10	9.53	MARCH_AR_283.1.pdf	RI/FS, Draft Final Report, Vol V of VII, OU-1, Appendices A - D-2		7/1/1994
View	20	0.47	MARCH_AR_313.pdf	Work Plan for Geophysical Survey, OU-2		7/1/1994
View	30	0.02	MARCH_AR_1073.pdf	Tetra Tech Letter to March ARB Concerning Final Revisions to Work Plan and SAP Addendums, Subsurface Investigation and Removal Action, OU-2, WP-02, WP-17, WP-36	Chu, Ronald J / Tetra Tech, Inc.	7/1/1994
View	20	0.08	MARCH_AR_1216.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Draft ROD, OU-1	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	6/30/1994
View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_1215.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on SEAMIST System, Work Plan, SS-31	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	6/29/1994
View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1214.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning No Comments on Work Plan, Geophysical Survey, OU-2	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	6/27/1994
View	100	0.24	MARCH_AR_315.pdf	Action Memorandum, Subsurface Investigation and Removal Action, WP-02		6/27/1994
View	10	0.02	MARCH_AR_1212.pdf	Base Letter to CFGD Concerning Notification of Commencement, Construction in Heacock Storm Channel, LF-04	Sabol, John R, Dr / 722 CES/CEV	6/24/1994
View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1213.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Concurrence, Draft Final Corrective Action Plan	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	6/24/1994
View	10	0.08	MARCH_AR_1210.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 22 Jun 94		6/22/1994
View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_1211.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 22 Jun 94		6/22/1994
View	10	0.05	MARCH_AR_1208.pdf	URS Letter to EPA Concerning Comments on Suggested Language, ROD, Vadose Zone Cleanup Decision Process, OU-1	Parrish, Kent E / URS Consultants	6/8/1994
View	10	2.17	MARCH_AR_453.pdf	Site HSP, OT-18		6/7/1994
View	20	0.06	MARCH_AR_1207.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Transmitting Response to Comments, Draft Final RI/FS, OU-1	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	6/6/1994
View	20	4.43	MARCH_AR_321.pdf	EE/CA, Draft Final SAP Addendum, WP-36		6/1/1994
View	20	4.61	MARCH_AR_322.pdf	Draft Final SAP Addendum, Subsurface Investigation/Removal Action, WP-02		6/1/1994

View	20	4.65	MARCH_AR_295.pdf	Draft Final SAP Addendum, Subsurface Investigation/Removal Action, WP-17		6/1/1994
View	30	0.04	MARCH_AR_1205.pdf	CRWQCB Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Proposal to Stabilize Slopes of Existing Landfill, Heacock Storm Channel, LF-04	Thibeault, Gerald J / California Regional Water Quality Control Board	5/25/1994
View	20	0.06	MARCH_AR_1204.pdf	Base Letter to CRWQCB Concerning Notification, Completed 404 Application, LF-04	Sabol, John R, Dr / 722 CES/CEV	5/20/1994
View	100	0.13	MARCH_AR_1200.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 11 May 94		5/19/1994
View	40	0.31	MARCH_AR_1203.pdf	Application for USACE Permit, Form 4345, LF-04	Sabol, John R, Dr / 722 CES/CEV	5/14/1994
View	10	0.02	MARCH_AR_1202.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 12 May 94		5/12/1994
View	70	0.06	MARCH_AR_1201.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 12 May 94		5/12/1994
View	30	0.10	MARCH_AR_1199.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Review Comments on Draft Work Plan, Additional Investigations, OU-2	Ghazi, Rizgar A / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	5/5/1994
View	20	0.04	MARCH_AR_1198.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Improvements and Further Review Comments, EE/CA, WP-02, WP-17, WP-36	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	5/2/1994
View	10	2.96	MARCH_AR_320.pdf	EE/CA, Final Site Specific HSP, WP-36		5/1/1994
View	10	3.16	MARCH_AR_475.pdf	Seamist System Work Plan, Vol II of II, Appendices A - E, SS-31		5/1/1994
View	20	0.68	MARCH_AR_474.pdf	Seamist System Work Plan, Vol I of II, SS-31		5/1/1994
View	20	3.27	MARCH_AR_413.pdf	Draft HSP, Stabilization of Storm Drain Bank, LF-04		5/1/1994
View	30	2.12	MARCH_AR_323.pdf	EE/CA, Final Site Specific HSP, WP-17		5/1/1994
View	40	4.34	MARCH_AR_414.pdf	Work Plan for Heacock Drainage Channel Improvements, LF-04		5/1/1994
View	30	0.17	MARCH_AR_1197.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Review Comments on Draft Final RI/FS Report, OU-1	Scandura, John E / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	4/27/1994
View	100	0.08	MARCH_AR_83.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 27 Apr 94		4/27/1994
View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_1192.pdf	CRWQCB Letter to CDTSC Concerning Review of Draft ROD, OU-1	Broderick, John / California Regional Water Quality Control Board	3/24/1994
View	100	0.06	MARCH_AR_265.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 16 Mar 94		3/17/1994
View	10	0.03	MARCH_AR_1190.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 16 Mar 94		3/16/1994
View	40	0.11	MARCH_AR_1191.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 16 Mar 94		3/16/1994
View	30	0.07	MARCH_AR_1189.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Draft Corrective Action Plan, OU-2	Ghazi, Rizgar A / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	3/7/1994
View	30	0.06	MARCH_AR_1187.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Draft Site Specific Corrective Action Plan, OU-2	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	3/2/1994
View	10	0.43	MARCH_AR_2143.pdf	Avian Study Report	Kobetich, Gail C. / United States Department of the Interior Fish and Wildlife Service	3/1/1994
View	70	0.07	MARCH_AR_264.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 16 Feb 94		2/17/1994
View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1185.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Draft Bioventing Pilot Test Work Plan, Former Diesel UST Areas, ST-35	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	2/16/1994
View	30	0.03	MARCH_AR_1184.pdf	EPA Letter to Regulators Concerning Comments From Meeting With Contractor, Corrective Action Plan	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	2/15/1994

View	40	0.03	MARCH_AR_1180.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 10 Feb 94		2/10/1994
View	40	0.06	MARCH_AR_1181.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 10 Feb 94		2/10/1994
View	10	0.03	MARCH_AR_1177.pdf	Base Letter to USACE Concerning Removal Action, LF-04	Sabol, John R, Dr / 722 CES/CEV	1/26/1994
View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1176.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Potential for Release, Flooding in Region, LF-04	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	1/26/1994
View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1175.pdf	USGS Letter to Base Concerning Review and Recommendations for Groundwater Program and Data, OU-1	Shulters, Michael V / US Geological Survey	1/21/1994
View	40	0.07	MARCH_AR_263.pdf	RAB Meeting Minutes, 19 Jan 94		1/20/1994
View	20	0.07	MARCH_AR_1174.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 19 Jan 94		1/19/1994
View	30	0.04	MARCH_AR_1173.pdf	BCT Meeting Minutes, 19 Jan 94		1/19/1994
View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_1171.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Draft SI Report, ST-43	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	1/14/1994
View	30	0.03	MARCH_AR_1172.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning Review Comments on SI Report, ST-43	Ghazi, Rizgar A / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	1/14/1994
View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1169.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning No Comments, Dye Tracer Study, UVB Technology, SS-31	Ghazi, Rizgar A / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	1/6/1994
View	20	0.06	MARCH_AR_1168.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Draft Human Health Risk Assessment, LF-06	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	1/5/1994
View	20	0.04	MARCH_AR_1167.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Unsatisfactory Revisions, Draft EE/CA, WP-02	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	1/4/1994
View	30	3.02	MARCH_AR_324.pdf	Revised Draft Basewide Groundwater Modeling Program Conceptual Model Development and Numerical Model Design Report		12/28/1993
View	40	0.05	MARCH_AR_293.pdf	Newspaper Article, "Toxic Waste Cleanup Under Way"		12/26/1993
View	10	0.02	MARCH_AR_1150.pdf	PRC Letter to EPA Concerning Tentative Schedule, Groundwater Sampling, UVB Technology, SS-31	Argus, Roger / PRC Environmental Management, Inc.	12/13/1993
View	20	0.05	MARCH_AR_1149.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Additional Site Characterization Work Plan Addendum, OU-1	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	12/3/1993
View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_1147.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Schedule for Completion of Remaining Tasks, OU-1	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	11/22/1993
View	10	0.05	MARCH_AR_1146.pdf	PRC Letter to EPA Concerning Schedule and Description of Sampling Activities, Draft Amendment to Final QAPP, SS-31	Argus, Roger / PRC Environmental Management, Inc.	11/17/1993
View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1145.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Request for Investigation of Landfills, Air Force Village West	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	11/12/1993
View	30	0.09	MARCH_AR_1144.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 09-10 Nov 93		11/10/1993
View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_1142.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on FFA, RI/FS Report, OU-1	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	10/28/1993
View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_1143.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Confirmation of Position on RA, Proposed Capping, LF-04	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	10/28/1993
View	40	0.07	MARCH_AR_1141.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 07 Oct 93		10/7/1993
View	20	0.13	MARCH_AR_216.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Review of Ecological Risk Assessment for OU-1	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	10/4/1993
View	20	0.10	MARCH_AR_410.pdf	Newspaper Article, "March Shows Environmental Concerns"		10/1/1993
View	40	0.32	MARCH_AR_176.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 14-15 Sep 93		9/14/1993

View	20	0.79	MARCH_AR_126.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Transmitting Review Comments on the OU-1 Draft RI/FS Report	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	9/1/1993
View	10	0.57	MARCH_AR_105.pdf	CDTSC Memorandum Concerning Draft RI/FS, OU-1	Considine, Kathleen A. / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	8/23/1993
View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_107.pdf	CRWQCB Letter to Base Concerning Review of Draft Proposed Plan, OU-1	Broderick, John / California Regional Water Quality Control Board	8/23/1993
View	20	0.04	MARCH_AR_82.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on Site Characterization Study, OT-42 (Bldg 3404)	Gaslan, Milasol C / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	8/19/1993
View	10	0.22	MARCH_AR_1162.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning High Turbidity in Groundwater Samples, Impact on Metals Analysis	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	8/9/1993
View	50	0.06	MARCH_AR_891.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 28-29 Jul 93		7/28/1993
View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1161.pdf	CRWQCB Letter to Base Concerning No Comments, Draft EE/CA, Removal Action, ST-33	Broderick, John / California Regional Water Quality Control Board	7/2/1993
View	10	4.14	MARCH_AR_250.pdf	Final, Stage 5, Child Development Center Expansion, Preliminary Endangerment Assessment Report		7/1/1993
View	81	0.06	MARCH_AR_234.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 16 Jun 93		6/30/1993
View	20	0.08	MARCH_AR_232.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning Approval of Preliminary Endangerment Assessment Report, Child Care Center Expansion	Scandura, John E / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	6/1/1993
View	10	0.04	MARCH_AR_555.pdf	Newspaper Article, "March Wins Air Force Environmental Award"		5/28/1993
View	20	0.04	MARCH_AR_1160.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Analytical Results, Baseline Sampling, SS-31	Simon, Michelle / EPA Region IX	5/21/1993
View	40	0.07	MARCH_AR_253.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 21 May 93		5/21/1993
View	10	0.02	MARCH_AR_1159.pdf	EPA Letter to CDOT Concerning Approval of SAP, ST-43	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	5/18/1993
View	30	0.03	MARCH_AR_1158.pdf	CRWQCB Letter to Base Concerning Guidance on Removal, OWS, SD-09	Broderick, John / California Regional Water Quality Control Board	5/17/1993
View	10	0.10	MARCH_AR_226.pdf	Base Letter to Regulators Concerning Removal, Main OWS, SD-09	Sabol, John R, Dr / 22 SPTG/DEV	5/14/1993
View	60	0.11	MARCH_AR_225.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 31 Mar 93 and Revised RPM Meeting Minutes, 23 Feb 93	Gysler, Carl E / The Earth Technology Corp.	4/15/1993
View	10	1.57	MARCH_AR_221.pdf	QAPP, UVB Technology Site Demonstration, SS-31		4/1/1993
View	30	9.64	MARCH_AR_222.pdf	Work Plan In-Situ Groundwater Remediation of Chlorinated VOC, OU-2, Site 2, Waste Oil Pit/Solvent Tanks		4/1/1993
View	20	0.09	MARCH_AR_1155.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Analysis, ST-43	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	3/12/1993
View	50	0.13	MARCH_AR_217.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 23 Feb 93		3/10/1993
View	10	0.35	MARCH_AR_441.pdf	Draft Bioventing Pilot Test Work Plan, Former Diesel UST Areas, ST-35		3/1/1993
View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1154.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Laboratory Analysis, SAP, OU-2	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	2/18/1993
View	40	0.06	MARCH_AR_69.pdf	TRC Meeting Minutes, 20 Jan 93	Ransford, Kim L / 22 ARW/PAV	2/5/1993
View	10	2.48	MARCH_AR_6.pdf	Soil Gas Survey, ITIR, OU-2		2/1/1993
				Newspaper Article, "Underground Pool of Jet		

View	30	0.04	MARCH_AR_215.pdf	Fuel to be Separated and Reused"		1/21/1993
View	30	0.04	MARCH_AR_291.pdf	Newspaper Article, "March Runs Year Ahead on Cleanup of Jet Fuel"		1/21/1993
View	30	0.08	MARCH_AR_214.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 20 Jan 93		1/20/1993
View	30	0.03	MARCH_AR_1153.pdf	CRWQCB Letter to Base Concerning Review Comments on RFA, Expanded Source Investigation	Broderick, John / California Regional Water Quality Control Board	1/12/1993
View	30	0.09	MARCH_AR_1152.pdf	Geo/Resource Letter to CDOT Concerning Comments on Draft Work Plan Revision	Poss, Frank R / Geo/Resource Consultants, Inc.	1/7/1993
View	30	0.77	MARCH_AR_212.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 03 Dec 92		12/3/1992
View	30	0.05	MARCH_AR_1134.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Remedial Work to Be Performed by CalTrans, ST-43	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	12/2/1992
View	10	3.34	MARCH_AR_1920.pdf	Stage 5, Final ITIR, Basewide Groundwater Monitoring Program, Summer Quarter 92		12/1/1992
View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_1133.pdf	Geo/Resource Letter to CDOT Transmitting Revised Page 1 for Response to Comments on Draft Work Plan	Poss, Frank R / Geo/Resource Consultants, Inc.	10/30/1992
View	20	0.26	MARCH_AR_1132.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on O&M Plan, SAP, HSP, Groundwater Extraction Treatment System	Ghazi, Rizgar A / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	10/22/1992
View	30	0.07	MARCH_AR_210.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 06 Oct 92		10/22/1992
View	40	0.28	MARCH_AR_1131.pdf	Base Memorandum Concerning Submissions for Regulator Review, O&M Plan, SAP, HSP, Groundwater Extraction Treatment System	McTiver, Shari P / 22 SPTG/DEV	10/19/1992
View	20	0.05	MARCH_AR_1130.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on O&M Plan, SAP, Groundwater Extraction Treatment System	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	10/10/1992
View	10	0.07	MARCH_AR_1129.pdf	AFVW Letter to EPA Concerning Comments on Site Development	Albers, Ken / Air Force Village West	10/8/1992
View	10	0.07	MARCH_AR_209.pdf	Base Letter to Distribution Transmitting Response Comments to Regulatory Agencies Review of Site Characterization Study, Bldg 3404	Sabol, John R, Dr / 22 SPTG/DEV	10/5/1992
View	20	0.04	MARCH_AR_1128.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Building and Safety Director Concerning Issuance of Grading and Building Permits, Air Force Village West	Scandura, John E / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	10/5/1992
View	40	0.19	MARCH_AR_1126.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Review Comments on RI Report, Risk Assessment, Data Use for Baseline Risk Assessment	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	9/30/1992
View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_201.pdf	CRWQCB Letter to Base Concerning Review of Draft Final SAP Addendum, OU-2	Broderick, John / California Regional Water Quality Control Board	9/21/1992
View	30	0.03	MARCH_AR_202.pdf	CRWQCB Letter to Base Concerning Review of Work Plan Prepared for the Department of Transportation	Broderick, John / California Regional Water Quality Control Board	9/21/1992
View	30	0.08	MARCH_AR_200.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Comments on the Draft Final Stage 5 Work Plan Addendum and the SAP Addendum	Arellano, Albert A, Jr / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	9/18/1992
View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1124.pdf	CRWQCB Letter to Base Concerning Review Comments on O&M Plan, SAP, Groundwater Extraction Treatment System	Broderick, John / California Regional Water Quality Control Board	9/16/1992
View	10	1.14	MARCH_AR_170.pdf	Site Characterization Study, OT-42		9/1/1992
View	20	0.04	MARCH_AR_1123.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Review Comments on Work Plan, Basewide SAP	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	9/1/1992

View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_194.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Completed Review of Draft Final Stage 5, Work Plan Addendum, and Stage 5 SAP, OU-2	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	8/27/1992
View	10	0.04	MARCH_AR_1118.pdf	AFVW Letter to EPA Concerning Results of Testing, Access Available to Confirm Findings	Farris, Jack K / Air Force Village West	8/26/1992
View	20	0.04	MARCH_AR_290.pdf	Newspaper Article, "New Cleanup Tests Set for Base"		8/26/1992
View	30	0.07	MARCH_AR_193.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 25 Aug 92		8/25/1992
View	40	0.12	MARCH_AR_191.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Site Characterization Study for Bldg 3404	Ghazi, Rizgar A / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	8/12/1992
View	20	0.07	MARCH_AR_190.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Completed Review of Work Plan and Appendix for RI/FS for Air Force Village West	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	8/10/1992
View	10	0.09	MARCH_AR_187.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 20 Jul 92	Sabol, John R, Dr / 22 SPTG/DEV	7/27/1992
View	20	0.03	MARCH_AR_186.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning 30 day Extension for Final RI/FS Work Plan and SAP, OU-2	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	7/24/1992
View	10	0.06	MARCH_AR_1116.pdf	Action Memorandum, Request for Removal Action, OU-1		7/17/1992
View	10	0.05	MARCH_AR_1113.pdf	CDTSC Letter to AFVW Concerning Comments on Preliminary Endangerment Assessment	Scandura, John E / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	6/29/1992
View	30	0.03	MARCH_AR_181.pdf	TRC Meeting Minutes, 14 May 92	Ransford, Kim L / 22 ARW/PA	6/24/1992
View	20	0.21	MARCH_AR_1112.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Preliminary Site Characterization Report	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	6/9/1992
View	20	0.04	MARCH_AR_1111.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments and Superfund Removal Procedures, Action Memorandum Guidance	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	6/2/1992
View	20	0.30	MARCH_AR_1110.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments and Superfund Removal Procedures, EE/CA, Draft Removal Action, ST-33	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	6/1/1992
View	20	0.02	MARCH_AR_1109.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Delay of Completing Construction, Groundwater Extraction and Treatment System	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	5/27/1992
View	10	0.05	MARCH_AR_1108.pdf	EPA Letter to Base Concerning Comments on Site Characterization Work Plan	Russell, Richard T / EPA Region IX	5/18/1992
View	20	0.08	MARCH_AR_1107.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 15 May 92		5/15/1992
View	20	0.26	MARCH_AR_172.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Concerning ARARs Information	Arellano, Albert A, Jr / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	4/30/1992
View	20	0.06	MARCH_AR_171.pdf	CDTSC Letter to Base Transmitting Review Comments on EE/CA, OU-3	Yemut, Emad B / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	4/17/1992
View	10	0.05	MARCH_AR_1101.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 09 Apr 92		4/9/1992
View	10	0.04	MARCH_AR_1099.pdf	CDTSC Letter to AFVW Concerning Proposed Expansion of Residential Development, LF-06	Hinton, John A / California Department of Toxic Substances Control	3/31/1992
View	100	0.12	MARCH_AR_1100.pdf	CRWQCB Letter to Base Concerning Review Comments on Stage 5, Work Plan Addendum, SAP Addendum, OU-2	Williams, Kenneth R / California Regional Water Quality Control Board	3/31/1992
View	20	0.07	MARCH_AR_166.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 03 Mar 92		3/3/1992
View	40	0.38	MARCH_AR_1095.pdf	Base Letter to EPA Concerning Status of CalTrans Environmental Cleanup Efforts, ST-43	Gross, Thomas H, LtCol / 22 ARW/DE	2/28/1992

View	20	0.24	MARCH_AR_161.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 23 Jan 92 and Project Status Reports	Poland, D Joan / 22 SPTG/DEV	2/7/1992
View	10	0.08	MARCH_AR_129.pdf	RPM Meeting Minutes, 15-16 Oct 91	Poland, D Joan / 22 SPTG/DEV	11/6/1991
View	20	0.97	MARCH_AR_111.pdf	Stage 5, Draft Final SAP Addendum for Defense Reutilization and Marketing Office (DRMO) and HQ 15AF Sites		11/5/1991